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SAVE 25%
ON MEN'S SWIMWEAR BY CATALINA: 

PIERRE CARDIN0 & CLUB ARENA0

Save 25% on Pierre Cardin® swimwear. Pat­
terns on top of patterns.. .the hottest looks 
under the sun. Proven here by Pierre Cardin. 
Choose from solid and striped trunks and 
coordinating tees. Shown here from our col­
lection: White oversized tee with chevron 
print, reg. 18.00, sale 13.50. Lined candy 
striped trunk with double side-entry 
pockets, reg. 25.00, sale 18.75. Imported in 
100% cotton. Sizes S-XL.

Save 25% on Ocean Gear® swimwear by 
Catalina®. Color blocking makes a high im­
pact on the beach front with coordinating 
swimwear by Catalina. Shown here from our 
collection: White zip-front terry cloth 
coverup with front pocket, reg. 32.00, sale 
24.00. Lined blue/red/aqua trunk with side 
pockets, reg. 26.00, sale 19.50. Imported and 
made in the US. A. of polyester/cotton. Top 
sizes S-XL and bottom sizes 32-38.

Save 25% on Club Arena® swimwear. 
Action-packed brights go a long way in 
casual beachwear. Matched with color- 
blocked trunks, the look is purely cool. 
Featured here from our collection of 100% 
cotton coordinates: Kahuna oversized white 
tank top with screened print back, reg. 20.00, 
sale 15.00. Matching blue/navy/white trunk, 
reg. 26.00, sale 19.50. Available in sizes S-XL. 
Made in the U.S.A.

In Men's Swimwear. Sale prices good through April 17.
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